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This book is not about the events of 1989, but about 1989 as a world event. Starting with the fall of the
Berlin Wall and the collapse of the Soviet bloc it examines the historical significance and the world brought
about by 1989.

When the Cold War ended in Europe it ushered in a world in which the international agenda is set outside
Europe, in America or Asia. The book critically examines and moves beyond some of the conveniently
simple paradigms proposed in the nineties, by leading political scientists such as Fukuyama and Huntington,
to show how the events of 1989 meant different things to different parties. This was an anti-utopian
revolution, a symbol of the possibility of non-violent transitions to democracy, which raised the hopes of
world-wide democratic changes. Contributors show how 1989 can be seen as the founding moment of a
globalized world, but equal attention should be given to the dispersion of its meanings and the exhaustion of
some of its main trends associated with the post-1989 era. Europe was reunited, yet it is in crisis. Twenty
years on, global markets have brought about a global financial crisis. The fall of the Berlin Wall was
celebrated as the advent of free movement in a world without borders. Now however, we can see that new
borders, walls, fences have since been built.

With an introductory essay by Vaclav Havel, 1989 as a Political World Event will be of interest to scholars
of European Politics and International Relations.
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From reader reviews:

Lois Hernandez:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they take because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this 1989 as a Political World Event: Democracy, Europe and the New
International System in the Age of Globalization (Global Order Studies).

Rex Oswald:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the time or they will get lot of
stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely yes. People
is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you possess when the spare
time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book you have read
is definitely 1989 as a Political World Event: Democracy, Europe and the New International System in the
Age of Globalization (Global Order Studies).

Patrick Leon:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This particular 1989 as a Political World Event: Democracy,
Europe and the New International System in the Age of Globalization (Global Order Studies) can give you a
lot of good friends because by you checking out this one book you have point that they don't and make you
more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-
book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than some other
make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let's have 1989 as a Political World Event: Democracy,
Europe and the New International System in the Age of Globalization (Global Order Studies).

Donna Muniz:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a publication we
can know everything we want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This reserve 1989 as a Political World Event: Democracy, Europe and the New
International System in the Age of Globalization (Global Order Studies) was filled about science. Spend
your free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has different feel
when they reading the book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a guide. In
the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you wanted.
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