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This one-hundred-page novella picks up where the international bestselling Die for Me trilogy ended and
follows the eternally irresistible Jules Marchenoir as he leaves Paris behind for a fresh start in New York
City.

Jules is a revenant—an undead being whose fate forces him to sacrifice himself over and over again to save
human lives. He's spent the last century flirting his way through Paris and, most recently, falling in love with
his best friend's girlfriend. Loyalty and heartbreak have led him to choose a new life in NYC.

Separated from his friends and his home, Jules is adrift in this dangerous new world, facing unknown
enemies . . . until he meets a revenant named Ava. Though the battle for France has been won, an epic war
between good and evil has just begun in the Big Apple, and Ava needs Jules's help to uncover the key to an
American victory. Jules finds himself in the same position he crossed an ocean to escape: at risk of losing his
immortal existence as well as his heart.

Epic Reads Impulse is a digital imprint with new releases each month.
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From reader reviews:

Janice Nolan:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled Die
Once More (Die for Me Book 2)? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can
spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it
is opinion or you have additional opinion?

Bruce Bracey:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important normally. The book Die Once More (Die for Me Book 2) seemed to be making you to
know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages
for you. The reserve Die Once More (Die for Me Book 2) is not only giving you much more new information
but also to get your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your
publication. Try to make relationship using the book Die Once More (Die for Me Book 2). You never really
feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Robert Haas:

Here thing why this kind of Die Once More (Die for Me Book 2) are different and reliable to be yours. First
of all reading a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. Die Once More (Die for Me Book 2) giving you information deeper and different
ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no publication that similar with Die Once More (Die for
Me Book 2). It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your eyes about the thing that happened in the
world which is probably can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in area, café, or even
in your way home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Die
Once More (Die for Me Book 2) in e-book can be your choice.

Sheri Williams:

This Die Once More (Die for Me Book 2) are usually reliable for you who want to be a successful person,
why. The main reason of this Die Once More (Die for Me Book 2) can be one of several great books you
must have will be giving you more than just simple examining food but feed you with information that
possibly will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever
your conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Die Once More (Die for Me Book 2) giving you
an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we
understand it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.
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