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On December 29, 1972 an Eastern Air Lines' Lockheed L-1011, as Flight 401 on its way from John F.
Kennedy International Airport, New York, to Miami International Airport, Miami, Florida, crashed at 2342
eastern standard time in the Everglades, approximately 18 miles west northwest of Miami International
Airport. The aircraft was destroyed. There were 163 passengers and a crew of 13 aboard the aircraft, 99
people died in the crash. The flight was diverted because of problems with the nose landing gear The aircraft
climbed to 2,000 feet while the crew attempted to correct the problem. Surviving passengers and
crewmembers stated that the flight was routine and operated normally before impact with the ground. The
National Transportation Safety Board determines that the probable cause of this accident, was preoccupation
with a malfunction of the nose landing gear position indicating system distracted the crew's attention from
the instruments and allowed the descent to go unnoticed.
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From reader reviews:

Douglas Whatley:

Here thing why this particular air crash investigations ghosts? the crash of eastern air lines flight 401 are
different and reliable to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good nonetheless it depends in the
content from it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. air crash investigations ghosts? the crash of
eastern air lines flight 401 giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any publication out
there but there is no publication that similar with air crash investigations ghosts? the crash of eastern air lines
flight 401. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing this happened in
the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in area, café, or
even in your means home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the
form of air crash investigations ghosts? the crash of eastern air lines flight 401 in e-book can be your
alternate.

Paul Hardy:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find publication
that need more time to be learn. air crash investigations ghosts? the crash of eastern air lines flight 401 can
be your answer because it can be read by you actually who have those short extra time problems.

Betty Patton:

The book untitled air crash investigations ghosts? the crash of eastern air lines flight 401 contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy means. The language is very
straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was compiled by famous
author. The author brings you in the new age of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you
can continue reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If
you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice learn.

Pauline Browne:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we would like. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This book air crash investigations ghosts? the crash of eastern air lines
flight 401 was filled with regards to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your
scientific disciplines competence. Some people has different feel when they reading the book. If you know
how big benefit of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like today, many ways
to get book that you just wanted.
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