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Stephanie Covington Armstrong does not fit the stereotype of a woman with an eating disorder. She grew up
poor and hungry in the inner city. Foster care, sexual abuse, and overwhelming insecurity defined her early
years. But the biggest difference is her race: Stephanie is black.
 
In this moving first-person narrative, Armstrong describes her struggle as a black woman with a disorder
consistently portrayed as a white woman’s problem. Trying to escape her selfhatred and her food obsession
by never slowing down, Stephanie becomes trapped in a downward spiral. Finally, she can no longer deny
that she will die if she doesn’t get help, overcome her shame, and conquer her addiction to using food as a
weapon against herself.
 
For more information about the book and eating disorders, visit www.notallblackgirls.com
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From reader reviews:

John Masterson:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or information even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to
you is you don't know what type you should start with. This Not All Black Girls Know How to Eat: A Story
of Bulimia is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you
want and want in this era.

Beverly Dyar:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they write
about the information about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays
always try to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to the book.
One of them is this Not All Black Girls Know How to Eat: A Story of Bulimia.

Lee Parkin:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you
examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your
knowledge, because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what
types of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and also
soon. The Not All Black Girls Know How to Eat: A Story of Bulimia will give you new experience in
looking at a book.

Gene Baker:

Beside this Not All Black Girls Know How to Eat: A Story of Bulimia in your phone, it might give you a
way to get closer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh
from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow village. It is good thing to
have Not All Black Girls Know How to Eat: A Story of Bulimia because this book offers to your account
readable information. Do you often have book but you don't get what it's about. Oh come on, that wil happen
if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful
island. So do you still want to miss the idea? Find this book and read it from right now!
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