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Sight and touch are two elementary, but highly complementary senses - for humans as well as for robots.
This monograph develops an integrated vision/force control approach for robotics, combining the advantages
of both types of sensors while overcoming their individual drawbacks. It shows how integrated vision/force
control improves the task quality in the sense of increased accuracy and execution velocity and widens the
range of feasible tasks. The unique feature of this work lies in its comprehensive treatment of the problem
from the theoretical development of the various schemes down to the real-time implementation of interaction
control algorithms on an industrial robot. The presented approach and its potential impact on the
performance of the next generation of robots is starting to be recognized by major manufacturers worldwide.
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From reader reviews:

Jonathan Peterson:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How people have to
be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Integrated Visual Servoing and
Force Control: The Task Frame Approach (Springer Tracts in Advanced Robotics) book as this book offers
you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt
in it everbody knows.

James Rodriguez:

The feeling that you get from Integrated Visual Servoing and Force Control: The Task Frame Approach
(Springer Tracts in Advanced Robotics) may be the more deep you excavating the information that hide
within the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be
aware of but Integrated Visual Servoing and Force Control: The Task Frame Approach (Springer Tracts in
Advanced Robotics) giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in
specific way that can be understood by simply anyone who read that because the author of this e-book is
well-known enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to
understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for
having this specific Integrated Visual Servoing and Force Control: The Task Frame Approach (Springer
Tracts in Advanced Robotics) instantly.

Travis Pope:

The guide with title Integrated Visual Servoing and Force Control: The Task Frame Approach (Springer
Tracts in Advanced Robotics) posesses a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of
benefit after read this book. That book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this e-book
represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the
world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book in your
smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Jennifer Meeks:

Publication is one of source of understanding. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students
but also native or citizen require book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. From the book Integrated Visual Servoing and Force Control: The Task Frame Approach (Springer
Tracts in Advanced Robotics) we can have more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? For
being creative person must prefer to read a book. Merely choose the best book that appropriate with your



aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this book Integrated Visual Servoing and Force Control: The Task
Frame Approach (Springer Tracts in Advanced Robotics). You can more inviting than now.
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