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The complete BATMAN: HARLEY AND IVY miniseries, accompanied by more than 100 pages of Paul
Dini’s other stories featuring the villainous BFFs. Breaking the law is never more fun than when your best
friend’s beside you!

Writer PAUL DINI and artist BRUCE TIMM, the creative minds behind the critically acclaimed Batman:
The Animated Series, follow up their Eisner-winning BATMAN: MAD LOVE with another tale featuring
the loony but loyal moll Harley Quinn, this time teaming up with her best gal pal, Poison Ivy. The duo’s
latest scheme will take them from the streets of Gotham to the jungles of South America to the bright lights
of Hollywood!

Collects stories from BATMAN: HARLEY AND IVY #1-3, BATMAN ADVENTURES ANNUAL #1,
BATMAN ADVENTURES HOLIDAY ANNUAL #1, BATMAN AND ROBIN ADVENTURES #8,
BATGIRL ADVENTURES #1, BATMAN: GOTHAM KNIGHTS #14 and BATMAN: BLACK AND
WHITE #3.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Kimmel:

As people who live in often the modest era should be revise about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will certainly
update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to
anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Batman: Harley and Ivy: The Deluxe Edition
is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want
and want in this era.

Minnie Rivera:

The knowledge that you get from Batman: Harley and Ivy: The Deluxe Edition is the more deep you digging
the information that hide inside words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this
book is hard to recognise but Batman: Harley and Ivy: The Deluxe Edition giving you enjoyment feeling of
reading. The copy writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood simply by anyone who
read the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your
vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We propose you for having that Batman: Harley and Ivy: The Deluxe Edition instantly.

Debbie Gray:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
study a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend
on what forms of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, and soon. The Batman: Harley and Ivy: The Deluxe Edition provide you with new experience in
studying a book.

Stephen Stansbury:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Batman: Harley and Ivy: The Deluxe Edition can
be the respond to, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending your extra time
by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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