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Bringing a provocative perspective to the poetry wars that have divided practitioners and critics for decades,
Gillian White argues that the sharp disagreements surrounding contemporary poetics have been shaped by
“lyric shame”?an unspoken but pervasive embarrassment over what poetry is, should be, and fails to be.

Favored particularly by modern American poets, lyric poetry has long been considered an expression of the
writer’s innermost thoughts and feelings. But by the 1970s the “lyric I” had become persona non grata in
literary circles. Poets and critics accused one another of “identifying” with lyric, which increasingly bore the
stigma of egotism and political backwardness. In close readings of Elizabeth Bishop, Anne Sexton,
Bernadette Mayer, James Tate, and others, White examines the social and critical dynamics by which certain
poems become identified as “lyric,” arguing that the term refers less to a specific literary genre than to an
abstract way of projecting subjectivity onto poems. Arguments about whether lyric poetry is deserving of
praise or censure circle around what White calls “the missing lyric object”: an idealized poem that is
nowhere and yet everywhere, and which is the product of reading practices that both the advocates and
detractors of lyric impose on poems. Drawing on current trends in both affect and lyric theory, Lyric Shame
unsettles the assumptions that inform much contemporary poetry criticism and explains why the emotional,
confessional expressivity attributed to American lyric has become so controversial.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Arnold:

This Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of Contemporary American Poetry book is absolutely not ordinary
book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is actually
information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a
lot of information you will get. That Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of Contemporary American Poetry
without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't
become worry Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of Contemporary American Poetry can bring if you are and
not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop
even phone. This Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of Contemporary American Poetry having excellent
arrangement in word and layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Charlotte Ramsey:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of Contemporary American
Poetry book is readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange
for enjoyable studying experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you.
The writer regarding Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of Contemporary American Poetry content conveys
prospect easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but
it just different by means of it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of
Contemporary American Poetry is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Armando Mosley:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of Contemporary American Poetry, you could tells your family, friends as
well as soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a e-book.

Norma Ochoa:

The book untitled Lyric Shame: The "Lyric" Subject of Contemporary American Poetry contain a lot of
information on it. The writer explains your ex idea with easy method. The language is very simple to
implement all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by
famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. You can read this book because



you can continue reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime.
In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site in addition to order it.
Have a nice study.
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