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"If students used structures that more closely tracked the movement of their mind, weaving their own slaloms
between the twins of knowledge and experience, readers would be more inclined to lean in and vicariously
experience that movement of the mind. Wouldn't they?"
-Gretchen Bernabei and Dorothy Hall

In their signature easy-to-implement style, Gretchen Bernabei and Dorothy Hall offer new options for
teaching expository writing that more realistically match the way readers actually think and writers actually
write. While many state assessments as well as the Common Core ask students to write about their opinions,
the goal in The Story of My Thinking is to help teachers take their kids through the various stages of the
writing process (from generating ideas to publication) in a way that breaks down the barrier between
"academic" writing and "creative" writing and helps kids produce vibrant nonfiction with voice and
conviction.

The Story of My Thinking provides 13 writing activities for familiar teaching situations, with step-by-step
lessons that help you bridge the gap between narrative and informative writing. Using the same classroom-
tested strategies that made Crunchtime a bestseller, the authors give the flexibility of dipping in and out of
the lessons as you need them. For example, "If you want them to explore topics for deep development and
systemic growth," use Gretchen's "Inner Streams/Gritty Life" activity along with the tools that help students
plan their thinking. Choose the lesson that matches your teaching situation today, and then another one
tomorrow.

When authentic, personal experiences replace canned, pre-written topics, and students are provided with
structures that reflect how readers read, their writing transforms from formulaic to passionate. And when
students have plenty of chances to write about topics that are meaningful to them, in a variety of ways, for a
variety of situations, then they will be ready for any writing assignment.
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From reader reviews:

Marlon Duenas:

The book The Story of My Thinking: Expository Writing Activities for 13 Teaching Situations can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave
the best thing like a book The Story of My Thinking: Expository Writing Activities for 13 Teaching
Situations? Wide variety you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give
many details for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or facts that
you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book The Story of
My Thinking: Expository Writing Activities for 13 Teaching Situations has simple shape nevertheless, you
know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appear the enormous world by open and read a
publication. So it is very wonderful.

Deana Smith:

It is possible to spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This The Story of My Thinking:
Expository Writing Activities for 13 Teaching Situations is simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the
beach, train along with soon. If you did not include much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the e-
book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Consequently
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Nicholas Sheen:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every
year had been exactly added. This publication The Story of My Thinking: Expository Writing Activities for
13 Teaching Situations was filled in relation to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about
your scientific research competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a book. If you know
how big good thing about a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now,
many ways to get book that you wanted.

Crystal Babin:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or to make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's soul or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally
there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't
see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on
this era, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this The Story of My Thinking: Expository Writing Activities for 13 Teaching
Situations can make you feel more interested to read.
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