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The Marriage of Opposites: by Alice Hoffman | A 15-Minute Summary & Analysis

Preview: The Marriage of Opposites outlines the life of a young Jewish girl who knew that she wanted more
than her life on the small island of St. Thomas. She dreams of Paris, but being a woman and having a deep
connection with her father, she finds that her dreams have to be pushed aside. Rachel Pomie always saw
herself as a free spirit, but she doesn’t feel so free when it comes to her arranged marriage. She says that she
will not believe in love, but her loveless marriage proves to add burdens to her life that strap her down even
further. When love does come for Rachel, it is forbidden. Making herself, her lover and all her children
outcasts, Rachel fights for her right to love whom she pleases.

PLEASE NOTE: This is a Summary and Analysis of the book and NOT the original book.

This companion includes the following: - Book Review - Character List - Summary of the Chapters -
Discussion Questions - Analysis of Themes & Symbols

This Analysis fills the gap, making you understand more while enhancing your reading experience.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Wing:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family
or just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by studying a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere?
It ok you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Summary and
Analysis: The Marriage of Opposites which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
notice.

Nick Zapata:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Summary and Analysis: The Marriage of
Opposites can be the response, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date,
spending your free time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have
than the others?

Rosalie Dietrich:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you need to do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in the top list
in your reading list will be Summary and Analysis: The Marriage of Opposites. This book and that is
qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and
review this book you can get many advantages.

Louis Cline:

A lot of publication has printed but it is different. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose
the best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is called of book
Summary and Analysis: The Marriage of Opposites. Contain your knowledge by it. Without causing the
printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most critical that, you
must aware about guide. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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