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Every culture has its legends. Those men and women whose legacies were so great that their stories have
been repeated generation to generation. A person of such impact that other cultures long detached from the
origins tell stories of these powerful individuals. Such is the story of Victor Deus. Unlike many such legends,
there was little need to embellish the deeds he and his allies accomplished. Some remember him as a savior,
some as a tyrant. There are whole worlds that worship him like a god, and others that raise him up as a devil.
All of these worlds agree upon one thing though, he was fiercely protective of his allies, and swiftly dealt
with his enemies.

How does one become such a figure? Loved by so many, yet feared by even more? The story is a long one,
and I hope you will bear with me as the story unfolds. One thing you must know about Victor Deus is that he
was not given time to be a child, for his formative years were full of training and despair. Therefore, it is
there where this story begins, a boy, barely able to hold a sword, thrust into events he cannot control.

Victor Deus (Heritage of the Blood: Book One) is the first book in a series of books that follow Victor Deus
and his ally's through an epic fantasy journey that will span many worlds and genres. The initial Arc will be
three to four books long and will be a coming of age story for the main protagonists. Although I am starting
with Victor at a young age, this will not be a young adult series. I have no plans for gratuitous sex or
violence, but there will be war, and all that goes along with it.

*12/29/14 book one has been re-edited and should make for a smoother read. (If you find something though,
feel free to yell at me about it on social media or by e-mail and I can fix it for the next reader)

Heritage of the Blood: Book Two is now available!

Books in the Heritage of the Blood Series:

Victor Deus - Meet the main characters of the story Victor and Shawnrik, and learn about the world that they
must grow up in.

Vitiosi Dei - War has once again ravaged Terroval. Victor and Shawnrik find themselves apart, and in very
different circumstances than they ever thought they would be in. Events are transpiring across the face of
Terrazil and beyond, and they are not patient enough to wait for our heroes to grow up.

Book Three(Summer 2016) - Just as one of our heroes worlds is starting to reform the others begins to fall
apart.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Williams:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you
can read any book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent 24
hours a day to reading a publication. The book Victor Deus (Heritage of the Blood Book 1) it doesn't matter
what good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this
book. In the event you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the particular e-book.
You can m0ore easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book offers
high quality.

Ismael Black:

The reason why? Because this Victor Deus (Heritage of the Blood Book 1) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the book waiting for you to snap this but latter it will zap you with the secret this inside. Reading
this book beside it was fantastic author who write the book in such remarkable way makes the content within
easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a
lot of benefits than the other book possess such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking
method. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were being you I will go to the publication store
hurriedly.

Richard Dutton:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Victor Deus (Heritage of the Blood
Book 1), you could enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang
type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its referred to as reading
friends.

Marylou Standley:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Victor Deus (Heritage of the
Blood Book 1) which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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