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Having a boyfriend in eighth grade makes me kind of a celebrity at school. I'm also known throughout the
spirit world--I've helped my ghost mom solve some tough cases. And now I'm on my biggest one of all . . . 
in Hollywood!
Everyone is so famous here. But there's no time for stargazing. Somehow I managed to stumble upon a
mystery right on Hollywood Boulevard. Homes of young celebs are being burglarized, and it's up to me to
figure out who's behind the million dollar crimes--and prove it to the Beverly Hills police. And to complicate
things? The ghost of a teen star is dying to help me. One thing you never hear in the land of glitz & glamour?
I so don't do famous.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Martha Williams:

The knowledge that you get from I So Don't Do Famous is a more deep you digging the information that
hide within the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard
to comprehend but I So Don't Do Famous giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The author conveys their
point in selected way that can be understood by means of anyone who read it because the author of this
publication is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is
therefore easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
recommend you for having that I So Don't Do Famous instantly.

Louise Graham:

Reading a book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to
improve their proficiency in writing, they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them
is this I So Don't Do Famous.

Marylouise Potter:

You may get this I So Don't Do Famous by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it
could possibly to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are
various. Not only by means of written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern
era similar to now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now,
choose your own personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange
yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Joseph Carter:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's soul or real
their leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
presently there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring
and also can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important in your
case. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this I So Don't Do Famous can make you experience more interested to read.
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