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This Norton Critical Edition presents significant examples of one of the most important bodies of
English poetry written before the Renaissance.

The texts of the seven romances included?Havelok, Ywain and Gawain, Sir Orfeo, Sir Launfal, The Awntyrs
off Arthure at the Terne Wathelyne, The Weddyng of Syr Gawen and Dame Ragnell, and The Sege off
Melayne?are complete, authoritative (rendered from the best manuscripts), and comprehensively glossed and
annotated for undergraduate readers. In addition to their literary importance, the seven romances were
chosen because they shed light on other important Middle English texts.

"Sources and Backgrounds" offers comparative analogues (many complete) to each of the seven romances.
These readings enable students to understand the genre in the context of related medieval ideas and attitudes.

"Criticism" collects four essays that provide a variety of perspectives on Middle English romances by Erich
Auerbach, John Finlayson, A. C. Baugh, and Gisela Guddat-Figge.

A Selected Bibliography is also included.
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From reader reviews:

Donald Kelley:

Book is actually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Middle English Romances (Norton
Critical Editions) will make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about
almost everything. But some of you think this open or reading a new book make you bored. It is not make
you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or suited book with you?

Emilio Lutz:

This book untitled Middle English Romances (Norton Critical Editions) to be one of several books that best
seller in this year, here is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will
easily to buy this kind of book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of the
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Smart phone. So there is no reason to you to past this publication from your list.

Geraldine Bagley:

The book Middle English Romances (Norton Critical Editions) has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you
make sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was published by the very famous author.
The author makes some research prior to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can find
the point easily after scanning this book.

Mary Quinn:

Why? Because this Middle English Romances (Norton Critical Editions) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will zap you with the secret it inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such incredible way makes the
content inside easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is
good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you
a lot of advantages than the other book get such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking
technique. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the guide store
hurriedly.
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