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New York City. 1964. Winter. 3 am. Twenty-eight year old Kitty Genovese was wrapping up a late night
shift as a bar manager. She got into her car and headed back to her apartment.

Kitty never made it back. After she parked her car, a stranger named Winston Moseley stabbed her as she
approached the building. Kitty yelled for help. Mosley ran off.

No one came to her rescue. Bleeding out, Kitty crawled into a hallway, but a locked door prevented her from
advancing any further. Mosley eventually returned, stabbed her, and raped her before finally fleeing the
scene for good. Almost an hour later, an ambulance finally arrived, but Kitty died before reaching the
hospital.

Days later, a New York Times reporter discovered that many witnesses saw the murder but did not call the
police. Psychology textbooks blame this on the "bystander effect" and situational paralysis. But in this Game
Theory 101 parable, William Spaniel shows how nice people rationally do not call the police on occasion.
The witnesses, caught in coordination problem, ignore the situation because they believe someone else will
make the phone call for them.

The Murder of Kitty Genovese shows how the coordination problem works from a game theoretical
perspective. It also proves that the police are less likely to receive a phone call as the number of witnesses
increases and that punishing allegedly irresponsible bystanders does not fully resolve the problem.
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From reader reviews:

Kristy Taylor:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person has distinct
personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't desire do
that. You must know how great and important the book Game Theory 101: The Murder of Kitty Genovese.
All type of book are you able to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet options or other social
media.

Gary Tawney:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Game Theory 101: The Murder of Kitty Genovese your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in most aspect that maybe not known for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging just
about every word written in a e-book then become one form conclusion and explanation which maybe you
never get just before. The Game Theory 101: The Murder of Kitty Genovese giving you one more
experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful data for your better life in this era.
So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will probably be pleased
when you are finished examining it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary
spending spare time activity?

Janice Wilson:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Game Theory 101: The Murder of
Kitty Genovese that give your fun preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading practice
all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world a great deal better then how they react
towards the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man or woman
but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for every you who want to start reading as
your good habit, you are able to pick Game Theory 101: The Murder of Kitty Genovese become your own
starter.

Joseph Johnson:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you
examine a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend
on what sorts of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics,
and soon. The Game Theory 101: The Murder of Kitty Genovese provide you with a new experience in
looking at a book.
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