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Like the knives it produces, Spyderco is an unusual company. A relative newcomer to the world of
knifemaking, the small, Golden, Colorado-based business launched in 1976 did things differently from the
start - and managed to take the knife world by storm in just a few decades. In this book, discover the history
and inner workings of the company whose design innovations have redefined the shape of the modern
folding knife and taken high-performance cutting to a new level. Find out how these odd-shaped knives with
the hole and the hump in the blade have made opening and carry more efficient, as well as how individual
models have met the specialized needs of EMTs, police officers, hunters, soldiers, survivalists and more.
Spyderco aficionado Ken Delavigne covers each product in detail - from Clipit folders and fixed-blade
knives to custom collaborations to sharpeners - describing how it was developed and why, what real-life
problem it solved and the design elements that make it unique. In addition, he explores the technical frontiers
where Spyderco has made so many inroads and previews what's on the drawing board for the new
millennium. Finally, he offers insight into the uncommon business philosophy and management style that
have allowed Spyderco to achieve such legendary success.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Horgan:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your information inside the
book that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel
happy read one with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The actual Spyderco Story: The New
Shape of Sharp is kind of publication which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Theresa Frost:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV,
or even playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look different you
can read any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day
long to reading a guide. The book Spyderco Story: The New Shape of Sharp it is extremely good to read.
There are a lot of those who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. Should
you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore easily
to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high quality.

Susan Douglas:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you go
through a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and
soon. The Spyderco Story: The New Shape of Sharp provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Sarah Porter:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Spyderco Story: The New Shape of Sharp can be
the answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by reading
in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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