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Examining the treatment of persons with mental disabilities in the criminal justice system, this book offers
new perspectives that are crucial to an understanding of the ways in which society projects onto criminal
defendants prejudices and attitudes about responsibility, free will, autonomy, choice, public safety, and the
meaning and purpose of punishment, all with a focus on ways to enhance dignity in the criminal trial
process. It is a detailed exploration of issues of adequacy of counsel; the impact of international human rights
law, following the ratification of the United Nations Convention on the Rights of Persons with Disabilities
(CRPD); the role of mental health courts; and the influence of therapeutic jurisprudence, procedural justice,
and restorative justice on the legal process. It considers all of these perspectives in the context of criminal
justice system issues such as competency findings, the insanity defense, and sentencing. Demonstrating how
the question of treatment of persons with mental disabilities in the criminal justice system is not only a vital
one for both scholars and practitioners, but also a central facet of international human rights law, this book
suggests policy development, further scholarly inquiries, and newly invigorated thinking and action to place
dignity at the core of the criminal justice system.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Ellefson:

Book will be written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the world. Close
to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve A Prescription for Dignity: Rethinking Criminal
Justice and Mental Disability Law will make you to always be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if
you can know about every little thing. But some of you think this open or reading a book make you bored. It
is not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with
you?

Noah Hansell:

This A Prescription for Dignity: Rethinking Criminal Justice and Mental Disability Law book is not ordinary
book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is usually
information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper a person read a lot of
information you will get. This A Prescription for Dignity: Rethinking Criminal Justice and Mental Disability
Law without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in imagining and analyzing.
Don't always be worry A Prescription for Dignity: Rethinking Criminal Justice and Mental Disability Law
can bring if you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it
in your lovely laptop even phone. This A Prescription for Dignity: Rethinking Criminal Justice and Mental
Disability Law having fine arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in
reading.

Eva Ammons:

The book untitled A Prescription for Dignity: Rethinking Criminal Justice and Mental Disability Law
contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy method. The language is
very easy to understand all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was
compiled by famous author. The author provides you in the new time of literary works. You can read this
book because you can please read on your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere
and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site and order it. Have a nice
read.

Mary Lamm:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is
called of book A Prescription for Dignity: Rethinking Criminal Justice and Mental Disability Law. You'll be
able to your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make
a person happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from



one spot to other place.
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