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A lot has changed in Neo-Gotham over the last year. Now balancing college, family, and crime fighting,
Terry McGinnis still dons the red and black suit as Batman. Bruce Wayne is no longer chirping in his ear,
however, replaced by the former Nightwing himself, Dick Grayson. One thing that never changes, though, is
someone’s always looking to bring the city to its knees.

Called in to investigate the death of Mayor Davis, Batman and his allies sense foul play. When someone
frees the inmates held in Davis’ pet project, the new Arkham Institute, those suspicions become dangerous
reality. But the menace behind these attacks is someone Batman has never faced before, an unknown
quantity. Calling himself Rewire, this electrically charged villain has plans for Neo-Gotham -- starting with
the end of Batman!

It’s a new era for Batman Beyond as writer KYLE HIGGINS (NIGHTWING, DEATHSTROKE) and artist
THONY SILAS (Venom) plug you into BATMAN BEYOND 2.0: REWIRED (collects stories from
BATMAN BEYOND UNIVERSE #1-8)!
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From reader reviews:

Boris Hansen:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of Batman Beyond 2.0: Rewired
book as basic and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Glenna Monaghan:

Now a day those who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot
more to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specially this Batman Beyond 2.0: Rewired book
since this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred pct
guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Bess Cook:

Batman Beyond 2.0: Rewired can be one of your basic books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that
straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in terminology,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The writer giving his/her
effort that will put every word into joy arrangement in writing Batman Beyond 2.0: Rewired however doesn't
forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource details that maybe
you can be certainly one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial
pondering.

Kyra Franson:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Batman Beyond 2.0: Rewired can be the
response, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your extra time
by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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