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A follow-up to Helterbran's popular Why Flamingos Are Pink: …and 250 other Things You Should Know,
this entertaining volume identifies more of the surprising explanations for the facts, tales, and lore associated
with day-to-day living and the world around us. Organized into seven categories, this book tells you why
birds perched on power lines aren't electrocuted; the origins of such expressions as "swan song" and "willy
nilly;" and the science behind such phenomena as ball lightning, blue glaciers, red tide, and thunder snow.
More than a mere compendium of trivia, this book is a springboard for learners of all ages.
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From reader reviews:

Jesse Linder:

This Why Rattlesnakes Rattle: ...and 250 Other Things You Should Know are generally reliable for you who
want to be considered a successful person, why. The main reason of this Why Rattlesnakes Rattle: ...and 250
Other Things You Should Know can be one of many great books you must have is definitely giving you
more than just simple reading food but feed you with information that perhaps will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book
and printed kinds. Beside that this Why Rattlesnakes Rattle: ...and 250 Other Things You Should Know
forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking
that could it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Robert Young:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the title Why Rattlesnakes
Rattle: ...and 250 Other Things You Should Know suitable to you? Often the book was written by popular
writer in this era. The particular book untitled Why Rattlesnakes Rattle: ...and 250 Other Things You Should
Knowis the main of several books which everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a number of
people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know
before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, so all of people can easily to comprehend the
core of this publication. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So that you can
see the represented of the world within this book.

Meredith Bailey:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book than can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more time
to be study. Why Rattlesnakes Rattle: ...and 250 Other Things You Should Know can be your answer mainly
because it can be read by anyone who have those short spare time problems.

Martha Royal:

The book untitled Why Rattlesnakes Rattle: ...and 250 Other Things You Should Know contain a lot of
information on this. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy means. The language is very
straightforward all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was
authored by famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary works. You can read this book
because you can read on your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime.
In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site as well as order it.
Have a nice study.
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