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Just how far can the principles of individual liberty be pushed? Walter Block pushes them just as far as he
can in defense of the activities of scallywags, rogues, rascals, and scoundrels. From the premise that
activities involving force and fraud are outlawed, Block defends all of those "capitalist acts between
consenting adults" that horrify right-thinking Americans by showing that they are actually beneficial.

"An outrageously funny yet ruthlessly logical book... If libertarians can't speak out forthrightly for individual
freedom in unpopular areas, we haven't the courage of our alleged convictions. This book ought to be the
cutting edge of the libertarian movement for years to come." -- D.T. Armentano

"Walter Block argues that some of the most socially offensive members of society--including prostitutes,
libelers and moneylenders--are 'scapegoats' whose actual social and economic value is not being appreciated.
Startling and illuminating! Block's lucid defenses often convince; sometimes they lead us to sharpen our
attack. In either case, the reader cannot fail to be instructed and challenged by this mind-stretching,
provocative, and occasionally infuriating book." -- Robert Nozick

"This witty and wonderful book is a veritable manual of the 'joy of freedom.' If we were only half as
interested in liberty as in lust, we would not have half the problems we have." -- Dr. Thomas Szasz

"It is a magnificent book, a trailblazer. I would call it 'Drano for Clogged Minds,' except that Drano is neither
amusing nor stimulating, and this book is both. Buy two copies--one for yourself and one for the person you
want most to catch up with you." -- Roger Lea MacBride

"There are things that I strongly agree with and things that I strongly disagree with, but the book throughout
is amusingly and sharply reasoned, courageous and always provocative." -- Henry Hazlitt

"Defending the Undefendable made me feel that I was once more exposed to the shock therapy by which,
more than fifty years ago, the late Ludwig von Mises converted me to a consistent free-market position.
Some may find it too strong a medicine, but it will still do them good even if they hate it." -- F.A. Hayek

"Until Prof. Block's book, no economist had the courage to tackle the moral and economic status of the
dozens of reviled and misunderstood occupations in our society." -- Murray Rothbard
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From reader reviews:

James Crow:

The book Defending the Undefendable: The Pimp, Prostitute, Scab, Slumlord, Libeler, Moneylender, and
Other Scapegoats in the Rogue's Gallery of American Society can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book Defending the Undefendable:
The Pimp, Prostitute, Scab, Slumlord, Libeler, Moneylender, and Other Scapegoats in the Rogue's Gallery of
American Society? Some of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim in which book can give
many data for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or facts
that you take for that, you could give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Defending the
Undefendable: The Pimp, Prostitute, Scab, Slumlord, Libeler, Moneylender, and Other Scapegoats in the
Rogue's Gallery of American Society has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for
you. You can appear the enormous world by available and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Jamie Lundquist:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new information. When you read a guide you will get new information since book is one of a number of
ways to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to
definitely imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to
others. When you read this Defending the Undefendable: The Pimp, Prostitute, Scab, Slumlord, Libeler,
Moneylender, and Other Scapegoats in the Rogue's Gallery of American Society, you could tells your
family, friends and soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a
guide.

Albert Shepherd:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your
cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If
you want to try out look for book, may be the publication untitled Defending the Undefendable: The Pimp,
Prostitute, Scab, Slumlord, Libeler, Moneylender, and Other Scapegoats in the Rogue's Gallery of American
Society can be good book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Hoyt Knapp:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know



everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This reserve Defending the Undefendable: The Pimp, Prostitute, Scab, Slumlord,
Libeler, Moneylender, and Other Scapegoats in the Rogue's Gallery of American Society was filled
regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some
people has several feel when they reading a book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can truly
feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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