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He doesn’t need his eyes to uncover her true beauty.

The League of Rogues, Book 3

Cedric, Viscount Sheridan, is cursed. Once the ton’s golden boy, the loss of his sight has left him a reclusive
shell of man. His days of womanizing, horse racing and pistol shooting lost forever.

Offered the chance to recapture a small part of his old life, he can’t refuse—even if it means accepting the
shocking proposal of the infamous ice maiden, Anne Chessley.

Still reeling from her father’s death, Anne’s deepest wish is to avoid the hordes of fortune hunters who will
soon be beating down her door. Proposing marriage to Cedric is an act of desperation, his unexpected
acceptance a strange and wonderful dream.

His only stipulation: she must respond passionately and wantonly in his bed. Her agreement barely crosses
her lips before he begins a sensual assault on the icy walls bitter secrets have built around her heart.

Yet even as they catch a glimpse of true happiness, betrayal is poised to sweep them away on opposing tides
of danger.

Warning: Contains an outwardly aloof heroine with a secretly tender heart, a once-notorious rake who isn’t
quite as rusty at seduction as he feared, and a band of rogues who join together to make sure happily-ever-
afters do come true.
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From reader reviews:

Jane Nelsen:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading
habit give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
guide you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want
sense happy read one having theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The particular Her Wicked
Proposal (The League of Rogues) is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Laura Mason:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a
lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader
with their story or their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
the data about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve
their ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write on their book. One of them is this
Her Wicked Proposal (The League of Rogues).

Jose Crawford:

This Her Wicked Proposal (The League of Rogues) is new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for
some information given it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you
know or perhaps you who still having little digest in reading this Her Wicked Proposal (The League of
Rogues) can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this book is easy to get by anyone.
These books build itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book contact form.
People who think that in book form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there isn't
any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you
actually. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book style for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Martin Kelley:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will
get it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of Her Wicked Proposal (The League of Rogues)
can give you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one book you have matter that they don't and
make you actually more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This e-book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than
additional make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We should have Her Wicked Proposal (The
League of Rogues).
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