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HOW COULD DRUMMER JIMMIE NICOL SIMPLY VANISH AFTER PLAYING WITH THE
BEATLES IN 1964? The Beatle Who Vanished is the first historical account of Jimmie Nicol, an unknown
drummer whose journey from humble beginnings to saving The Beatles' first world tour was only one part of
his legend. Though his 13 days of fame made headlines, the true mystery of Nicol's story is riddled with
blacklisting, betrayal, drugs, divorce, bankruptcy and an eventual disappearance that led many to question
whether he is dead or alive. Discover the incredible details of a Beatles story never before revealed! *Draws
on new documentary evidence *Interviews with The Beatles, Nicol and eyewitnesses *Inner circle tour
accounts of Nicol and The Beatles *Uncovers the secrets behind his post-Beatles career and disappearance
*Over 100 rare archival photographs and memorabilia illustrations * Features a Foreword by Former Beatles
Bass Player, Chas Newby
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From reader reviews:

Philip Logan:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book The Beatle Who Vanished. You can choose the
best book if you appreciate reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any book The Beatle
Who Vanished. You can add information and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely
right, due to the fact from book you can know everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you may
be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we are able to
open a book or even searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel weary
to go to the library. Let's learn.

Gary Forsyth:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With looking at you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their reader
with their story as well as their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write
about the ability about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to
improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of
them is this The Beatle Who Vanished.

Yvonne Speight:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in
the top listing in your reading list will be The Beatle Who Vanished. This book that is qualified as The
Hungry Slopes can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this guide you
can get many advantages.

Issac Molina:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social such as
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching for the
The Beatle Who Vanished when you required it?
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