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Robert's Rules of Order have been around since 1876, when Henry Martyn Robert published the first edition
of his book, which was then known as the Pocket Manual of Rules of Order for Deliberative Assemblies.
The book based its outline on the House of Representatives' meeting procedures and adapted these methods
for use in society as a whole.

Since these rules debuted, they have become the most commonly adopted parliamentary method in the
United States, with approximately 95 percent of all clubs, organizations, and governments practicing them.
When the copyrights of the original editions expired, many other Robert's Rules of Order began to surface.
Today, many of these books are the same - with one apparent problem: a lack of focus on current trends,
specifically the Internet.

However, The Complete Guide to Robert's Rules of Order Made Easy emphasizes this fact and stresses how
society has changed due to the advent of the Internet. Clubs, organizations, and societies need to know how
to meet and communicate online, and this book provides the answer. In this book you will learn about
technology, conducting meetings online, communicating online, teleconferences, Web conferences, and Web
seminars. You will also learn the proper ways to address and send e-mails, as well as how to communicate
using instant messenger software.

The Internet has transformed the meeting space, and you need to incorporate these changes into your
meetings. Additionally, you will learn about all the more traditional rules, including such things as quorum,
abstention votes, votes of no confidence, friendly amendments, proxy votes, executive sessions, points of
privilege, parliamentary inquiries, and debates. You will also learn how you can adopt Robert's Rules of
Order, how to qualify as a legal meeting, how to follow the standard order of business, how to handle a
motion, and how to nominate and elect officers.

Also included is a discussion of the various motions, including privileged, incidental, subsidiary, main, and
unclassified, as well as the basic by-laws and the required paperwork, such as minutes, treasurer's reports,
and committee reports. The Complete Guide to Robert's Rules of Order Made Easy will serve as your guide
to conducting orderly and fair meetings in the 21st century. The rules for using the Internet as a meeting and
communication space are clearly defined, easy to understand, and simple to apply.

Atlantic Publishing is a small, independent publishing company based in Ocala, Florida. Founded over
twenty years ago in the company president’s garage, Atlantic Publishing has grown to become a renowned
resource for non-fiction books. Today, over 450 titles are in print covering subjects such as small business,
healthy living, management, finance, careers, and real estate. Atlantic Publishing prides itself on producing
award winning, high-quality manuals that give readers up-to-date, pertinent information, real-world
examples, and case studies with expert advice.  Every book has resources, contact information, and web sites
of the products or companies discussed.

This Atlantic Publishing eBook was professionally written, edited, fact checked, proofed and designed.



The print version of this book is 288 pages and you receive exactly the same content. Over the years our
books have won dozens of book awards for content, cover design and interior design including the
prestigious Benjamin Franklin award for excellence in publishing. We are proud of the high quality of
our books and hope you will enjoy this eBook version.
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From reader reviews:

Irma Huges:

This The Complete Guide to Robert's Rules of Order Made Easy: Everything You Need to Know Explained
Simply book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get
by reading this book is definitely information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get details which
is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. That The Complete Guide to Robert's Rules
of Order Made Easy: Everything You Need to Know Explained Simply without we comprehend teach the
one who looking at it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't become worry The Complete
Guide to Robert's Rules of Order Made Easy: Everything You Need to Know Explained Simply can bring if
you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it in your
lovely laptop even cell phone. This The Complete Guide to Robert's Rules of Order Made Easy: Everything
You Need to Know Explained Simply having great arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not
feel uninterested in reading.

Betty Walsh:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will get
large amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity
do you have when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right.
Then ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book
you have read is definitely The Complete Guide to Robert's Rules of Order Made Easy: Everything You
Need to Know Explained Simply.

Danna Bullock:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to know that reading
is very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge,
except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update about something by book.
Different categories of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is this The Complete
Guide to Robert's Rules of Order Made Easy: Everything You Need to Know Explained Simply.

Dawn Fernandez:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source this filled
update of news. In this particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you.
From media social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and



comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just seeking the The Complete Guide to Robert's Rules of Order Made Easy: Everything You Need
to Know Explained Simply when you required it?
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