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Leading neuroscientist Gordon M. Shepherd embarks on a paradigm-shifting trip through the "human brain
flavor system," laying the foundations for a new scientific field: neurogastronomy. Challenging the belief
that the sense of smell diminished during human evolution, Shepherd argues that this sense, which
constitutes the main component of flavor, is far more powerful and essential than previously believed.

Shepherd begins Neurogastronomy with the mechanics of smell, particularly the way it stimulates the nose
from the back of the mouth. As we eat, the brain conceptualizes smells as spatial patterns, and from these
and the other senses it constructs the perception of flavor. Shepherd then considers the impact of the flavor
system on contemporary social, behavioral, and medical issues. He analyzes flavor's engagement with the
brain regions that control emotion, food preferences, and cravings, and he even devotes a section to food's
role in drug addiction and, building on Marcel Proust's iconic tale of the madeleine, its ability to evoke deep
memories.

Shepherd connects his research to trends in nutrition, dieting, and obesity, especially the challenges that
many face in eating healthily. He concludes with human perceptions of smell and flavor and their
relationship to the neural basis of consciousness. Everyone from casual diners and ardent foodies to wine
critics, chefs, scholars, and researchers will delight in Shepherd's fascinating, scientific-gastronomic
adventures.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Abrams:

The guide with title Neurogastronomy: How the Brain Creates Flavor and Why It Matters contains a lot of
information that you can study it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist
new knowledge the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world currently.
That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you with new era
of the syndication. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you
want.

Betty Perez:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you
can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Neurogastronomy: How the
Brain Creates Flavor and Why It Matters which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
observe.

Filiberto Dacosta:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and Neurogastronomy: How the Brain
Creates Flavor and Why It Matters or others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the
truly amazing a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or
perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In various other
case, beside science publication, any other book likes Neurogastronomy: How the Brain Creates Flavor and
Why It Matters to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Anthony Carter:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the book Neurogastronomy: How the Brain Creates
Flavor and Why It Matters to make your own reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading ability is
developing when you just like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it and
mingle the feeling about book and reading especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open up a
book and go through it. Beside that the book Neurogastronomy: How the Brain Creates Flavor and Why It
Matters can to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing
of their time.
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