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Unearth the true story of green-thumbed pioneer and activist Kate Sessions, who helped San Diego
grow from a dry desert town into a lush, leafy city known for its gorgeous parks and gardens.

Katherine Olivia Sessions never thought she’d live in a place without trees. After all, Kate grew up among
the towering pines and redwoods of Northern California. But after becoming the first woman to graduate
from the University of California with a degree in science, she took a job as a teacher far south in the dry
desert town of San Diego. Where there were almost no trees.

Kate decided that San Diego needed trees more than anything else. So this trailblazing young woman
singlehandedly started a massive movement that transformed the town into the green, garden-filled oasis it is
today. Now, more than 100 years after Kate first arrived in San Diego, her gorgeous gardens and parks can
be found all over the city.

Part fascinating biography, part inspirational story, this moving picture book about following your dreams,
using your talents, and staying strong in the face of adversity is sure to resonate with readers young and old.
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From reader reviews:

Lorenzo Davis:

The book The Tree Lady: The True Story of How One Tree-Loving Woman Changed a City Forever can
give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave the good thing like a
book The Tree Lady: The True Story of How One Tree-Loving Woman Changed a City Forever? Some of
you have a different opinion about book. But one aim in which book can give many information for us. It is
absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that,
you are able to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book The Tree Lady: The True Story of How
One Tree-Loving Woman Changed a City Forever has simple shape but you know: it has great and big
function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by open up and read a reserve. So it is very
wonderful.

Samuel Rascon:

Beside this specific The Tree Lady: The True Story of How One Tree-Loving Woman Changed a City
Forever in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The
information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh through the oven so don't possibly be worry if
you feel like an outdated people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have The Tree Lady: The True
Story of How One Tree-Loving Woman Changed a City Forever because this book offers to you personally
readable information. Do you often have book but you don't get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not
end up to happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, similar
to treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the item? Find this book and read it from
right now!

Miriam Normandin:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-book
way, more simple and reachable. This The Tree Lady: The True Story of How One Tree-Loving Woman
Changed a City Forever can give you a lot of close friends because by you investigating this one book you
have point that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This specific book can be
one of one step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't
learn, by knowing more than different make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have
The Tree Lady: The True Story of How One Tree-Loving Woman Changed a City Forever.

Dianne Janelle:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen will need book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those textbooks have
many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. Through the
book The Tree Lady: The True Story of How One Tree-Loving Woman Changed a City Forever we can



acquire more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must choose to
read a book. Simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change
your life at this book The Tree Lady: The True Story of How One Tree-Loving Woman Changed a City
Forever. You can more appealing than now.
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